



Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
CENTER FOR HEALTH DEVELOPMENT
 Cordillera Administrative Region
 Baguio City



BAC Resolution No. 2020-087
IB 2020-14 (REGULAR)
PROCUREMENT OF REPRODUCTION AND PRINTING SERVICES

RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR ITEM NOS. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 10, 11, 14, 16, 17, 18, 19 & 20, AND, DECLARING FAILURE OF BIDDING FOR ITEM NOS. 9, 12, 13 & 15 FOR THE PROCUREMENT OF REPRODUCTION & PRINTING SERVICES for CY 2019 REQUIREMENTS

WHEREAS, Open Competitive Bidding for the Procurement of Reproduction and Printing Services for CY 2019 requirements was conducted in accordance with the Republic Act 9184 (RA 9184) and its Revised Implementing Rules and Regulations;

WHEREAS, on August 15, 2020, the Invitation to Bid (IB) was posted in the PhilGEPS;

WHEREAS, a Pre-bidding Conference was held on August 25, 2020 at 1:00 pm at DOH-CAR Office Regional Training Center, BGHMC Compound, Baguio City where no prospective bidder/s attended;

WHEREAS, the Submission and Opening of Bids took place as scheduled on September 07, 2020 at 1:30 pm at the Regional Training Center, Department of the Health-Center for Health Development-Cordillera Administrative Region (DOH-CHD-CAR) Office, BGHMC Compound, Baguio City;

WHEREAS, one (1) prospective bidder, Anglowealth Enterprise, procured the bidding documents and submitted their respective proposal;

WHEREAS, the first envelope containing the Eligibility and Technical Documents was opened. The presence, completeness and correctness of the required documents was checked and verified by the BAC in the presence of the prospective bidders' representative. Upon checking, Anglowealth Enterprises was declared "ELIGIBLE" and was rated "PASSED";

WHEREAS, the second envelope containing the Financial Proposal was opened. The presence, completeness and correctness of the required documents was checked and verified by the BAC. Upon checking, Anglowealth Enterprises was declared "ELIGIBLE", was rated "PASSED" and subsequently the bid proposal was read publicly and written in the Abstract of Bids, to wit:

IB 2020-14 Procurement of Reproduction and Printing Services							
Name of Company						Anglowealth Enterprises	
Bid Security Form						BSD	
Amount of Security						N/A	
Item No.	Item/ Specs	Total Quantity	Unit	ABC per Unit	Total ABC		
1	Booklet on DOH-CHD-CAR program briefer, size: 8.5" x 11", Material: C2S80, saddle binding, full color, 76 pages, winning bidder to provide sample before mass production	200	piece	250.00	50,000.00	49,200.00	
2	Booklet on National Aedes-Borne Viral Diseases Prevention and Control Program: Manual of Procedures, size: 12" x 9", cover: chrome coat 200, soft bound, inside pages: C2S90, total pages for 1 set: 577 (excluding cover), total sheets for 1 set: 288.5 (excluding cover), full color, binding: saddle stitch, with pocket/set (10 booklets/set)	150	set	2,000.00	300,000.00	288,000.00	
3	Brochure of Various Kinds, C2S80, size: 8.5" x 11", full color, 1 fold, 2 panels, 4 kinds, packed by 100s	4,000	piece	5.00	20,000.00	17,400.00	

4	Flyer of Various Kinds, C2S80, size: 8.5" x 11", full color, 2 folds, 3 panels, 4 kinds, packed by 100s	4,000	piece	5.00	20,000.00	17,400.00
5	Leaflet of Various Kinds, size: 8.5" x 11", full color, C2S80, 2 folds, 3 panels, 4 kinds, packed by 100s	4,000	piece	6.00	24,000.00	22,400.00
6	Poster of Various Kinds, size: 18" x 24", full color, Chrome Coat# 189, 4 kinds, packed by 100s	4,000	piece	21.00	84,000.00	76,720.00
7	Printing of NTP MOP 6th edition Pocket Guide, 92 pages (46 sheets) excluding cover, back to back printing, soft bond, 1/2 A4 cover page: C2S120 in full color, inside page: C2S80 in full color	300	piece	150.00	45,000.00	44,154.00
8	Printing of NTP MOP 6th edition, 190 pages (95 sheets) excluding cover, back to back printing, soft bond, A4 cover page: C2S120 in full color, inside page: C2S80 in full color	200	piece	250.00	50,000.00	49,600.00
9	Reproduction of FWBD CPG (Pocket Guide), Size: 5"(W) x 7"(L); Stock: Cover-C2S140#, Inside-Matt 80#; Color: Cover-Full Color (4/2) with UV Lamination, Inside-Full Color (4/4); No. of pages: 31 pp. excluding Cover; Binding: Perfect Binding; Others: with Die Cut Paper per Divider	150	copy	200.00	30,000.00	NO BID
10	Reproduction of FWBD CPG (Reference Manual), Size: 5 1/2"(W) x 8 1/2"(L); Stock: Cover-C2S140#, Inside-Matt 80#; Color: Cover-Full Color (4/0) with Matte Lamination, Inside-Full Color (4/4); No. of pages: 120 pp. excluding Cover; Binding: Perfect Binding; Others: with Die Cut Paper per Divider	150	copy	360.00	54,000.00	53,550.00
11	Reproduction of FWBD MOP, Size: 5 1/2"(W) x 8 1/2"(L); Stock: Cover-C2S140#, Inside-Matt 80#; Color: Cover-Full Color (4/0) with Matte Lamination, Inside-Full Color (4/4); No. of pages: 120 pp. excluding Cover; Binding: Perfect Binding	150	copy	360.00	54,000.00	53,550.00
12	Reproduction of GMEF Handbook, specifications: 11" x 8.5", 75 pages, saddle stitch binding, inside pages: C2S80, cover page: chrome coat 189, back to back	70	piece	100.00	7,000.00	NO BID
13	Reproduction of HGDG Handbook, specifications: 11" x 8.5", 195 pages, saddle stitch binding, inside pages: C2S80/black and white, cover page: chrome coat 189/colored/back to back	70	piece	210.00	14,700.00	NO BID
14	Reproduction of Pinggang Pinay Brochure for different age groups: Kids 3-12 years old, 13-185 years old, Adults 19-59 years old, Elderly 60 years and above, and Pregnant and Lactating Women; 1 set is to 5 brochures; size: 17" x 11" (spread), stock: C2S #120 with UV Lamination two sides, color: Full Color, 3 folds with scoring two sides printing, process: Offset Printing	1,285	set	70.00	89,950.00	88,022.50
15	Reproduction/Reprinting of Community Maternal Nutrition and Infant and Young Child Feeding Peer Counselling Training Toolkit FACILITATOR's MANUAL, 258 pages back to back, full color, spring binded, clear PVC cover, printed at the last page: (DOH Logo) Reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera	30	piece	400.00	12,000.00	NO BID

16	Reproduction/Reprinting of Community Maternal Nutrition and Infant and Young Child Feeding Peer Counselling Training Toolkit PARTICIPANT's MANUAL, 274 pages back to back, full color, spring binded, clear PVC cover, printed at the last page: (DOH Logo) Reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera	235	piece	400.00	94,000.00	92,590.00
17	Sintra Board with Benefits of Breastfeeding print for Mommies and Babies, size: 24 inches x 18 inches, 3mm thick, durable surface, flexible, resist moisture and decay, printed on the lower right part: (DOH Logo) reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera	100	piece	450.00	45,000.00	36,000.00
18	Sintra Board with Ten Steps to Successful Breastfeeding print, size: 36 inches x 24 inches, 3mm thick, durable surface, flexible, resist moisture and decay, printed on the lower right part: (DOH Logo) reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera	165	piece	550.00	90,750.00	79,200.00
19	Sintra Board with The Risks of Formula Feeding, size: 24 inches x 18 inches, 3mm thick, durable surface, flexible, resist moisture and decay, printed on the lower right part: (DOH Logo) reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera	61	piece	450.00	27,450.00	21,960.00
20	Sticker of Various Kinds, size: 8" x 4", matte finish, self adhesive, full color, 4 kinds, packed by 100s	4,000	piece	7.00	28,000.00	26,400.00

WHEREAS, the bids for the items listed below were found to be substantially complying;

Item No. 1 - Booklet on DOH-CHD-CAR program briefer, size: 8.5" x 11", Material: C2S80, saddle binding, full color, 76 pages, winning bidder to provide sample before mass production

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 50,000.00	₱ 49,200.00	1.60%

Item No. 2 - Booklet on National Aedes-Borne Viral Diseases Prevention and Control Program: Manual of Procedures, size: 12" x 9", cover: chrome coat 200, soft bound, inside pages: C2S90, total pages for 1 set: 577 (excluding cover), total sheets for 1 set: 288.5 (excluding cover), full color, binding: saddle stitch, with pocket/set (10 booklets/set)

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 300,000.00	₱ 288,000.00	4.00%

Item No. 3 - Brochure of Various Kinds, C2S80, size: 8.5" x 11", full color, 1 fold, 2 panels, 4 kinds, packed by 100s

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 20,000.00	₱ 17,400.00	13.00%

Item No. 4 - Flyer of Various Kinds, C2S80, size: 8.5" x 11", full color, 2 folds, 3 panels, 4 kinds, packed by 100s

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 20,000.00	₱ 17,400.00	13.00%

Item No. 5 - Leaflet of Various Kinds, size: 8.5" x 11", full color, C2S80, 2 folds, 3 panels, 4 kinds, packed by 100s

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 24,000.00	₱ 22,400.00	6.67%

Item No. 6 - Poster of Various Kinds, size: 18" x 24", full color, Chrome Coat# 189, 4 kinds, packed by 100s

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 84,000.00	₱ 76,720.00	8.67%

Item No. 7 - Printing of NTP MOP 6th edition Pocket Guide, 92 pages (46 sheets) excluding cover, back to back printing, soft bond, 1/2 A4 cover page: C2S120 in full color, inside page: C2S80 in full color

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 45,000.00	₱ 44,154.00	1.88%

Item No. 8 - Printing of NTP MOP 6th edition, 190 pages (95 sheets) excluding cover, back to back printing, soft bond, A4 cover page: C2S120 in full color, inside page: C2S80 in full color

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 50,000.00	₱ 49,600.00	0.80%

Item No. 10 - Reproduction of FWBD CPG (Reference Manual), Size: 5 1/2"(W) x 8 1/2"(L); Stock: Cover-C2S140#, Inside-Matt 80#; Color: Cover-Full Color (4/0) with Matte Lamination, Inside-Full Color (4/4); No. of pages: 120 pp. excluding Cover; Binding: Perfect Binding; Others: with Die Cut Paper per Divider

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 54,000.00	₱ 53,550.00	0.83%

Item No. 11 - Reproduction of FWBD MOP, Size: 5 1/2"(W) x 8 1/2"(L); Stock: Cover-C2S140#, Inside-Matt 80#; Color: Cover-Full Color (4/0) with Matte Lamination, Inside-Full Color (4/4); No. of pages: 120 pp. excluding Cover; Binding: Perfect Binding

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 54,000.00	₱ 53,550.00	0.83%

Item No. 14 - Reproduction of Pinggang Pinay Brochure for different age groups: Kids 3-12 years old, 13-185 years old, Adults 19-59 years old, Elderly 60 years and above, and Pregnant and Lactating Women; 1 set is to 5 brochures; jsize: 17" x 11" (spread), stock: C2S #120 with UV Lamination two sides, color: Full Color, 3 folds with scoring two sides printing, process: Offset Printing

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 89,950.00	₱ 88,022.50	2.14%

Item No. 16 - Reproduction/Reprinting of Community Maternal Nutrition and Infant and Young Child Feeding Peer Counselling Training Toolkit PARTICIPANT's MANUAL, 274 pages back to back, full color, spring binded, clear PVC cover, printed at the last page: (DOH Logo) Reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 94,000.00	₱ 92,590.00	1.50%

Item No. 17 - Sintra Board with Benefits of Breastfeeding print for Mommies and Babies, size: 24 inches x 18 inches, 3mm thick, durable surface, flexible, resist moisture and decay, printed on the lower right part: (DOH Logo) reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 45,000.00	₱ 36,000.00	20.00%

Item No. 18 - Sintra Board with Ten Steps to Successful Breastfeeding print, size: 36 inches x 24 inches, 3mm thick, durable surface, flexible, resist moisture and decay, printed on the lower right part: (DOH Logo) reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 90,750.00	₱ 79,200.00	12.73%

Item No. 19 - Sintra Board with The Risks of Formula Feeding, size: 24 inches x 18 inches, 3mm thick, durable surface, flexible, resist moisture and decay, printed on the lower right part: (DOH Logo) reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 27,450.00	₱ 21,960.00	20.00%

Item No. 20 - Sticker of Various Kinds, size: 8" x 4", matte finish, self adhesive, full color, 4 kinds, packed by 100s

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Anglowealth Enterprises	₱ 28,000.00	₱ 26,400.00	5.71%

WHEREAS, letter dated September 8, 2020 was sent to Anglowealth Enterprises requesting to submit post qualification requirements;

WHEREAS, on September 10, 2020, Anglowealth Enterprises submitted their respective additional documentary requirements as part of their technical requirements;

WHEREAS, on September 8-15, 2020, detailed evaluation of the submitted proposal on the Legal, Technical and Financial aspects of documents on the Lowest Calculated Bidders (LCBs) for the above items was undertaken by the designated Technical Working Group (TWG);

WHEREAS, on September 10, 2020, the TWG presented to the BAC their Bid Evaluation and Post Qualification Reports citing specific findings on the submitted documents/clarifications by the LCB for each item;

WHEREAS, on September 15, 2020, the TWG submitted their Bid Evaluation and Post Qualification Reports citing specific findings on the submitted documents/clarifications by the LCB for each item;

WHEREAS, the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC) certifies that there is "no pending incident" as regard to the result of the post qualification evaluation for this particular project;

NOW THEREFORE, on the basis of the above, the herein members of the BAC HEREBY RESOLVE, to award the items listed below to the following bidder that was determined to have the Single Calculated and Responsive Bid (SCRB):

- Anglowealth Enterprises with a Total Contract Price of One Million Sixteen Thousand One Hundred Forty-Six Pesos and Fifty Centavos only (₱ 1,016,146.50) inclusive of local taxes for the item listed below:**

Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Cost	Total Bid Price (PhP)
1	Booklet on DOH-CHD-CAR program briefer, size: 8.5" x 11", Material: C2S80, saddle binding, full color, 76 pages, winning bidder to provide sample before mass production	200	piece	₱ 246.00	₱ 49,200.00
2	Booklet on National Aedes-Borne Viral Diseases Prevention and Control Program: Manual of Procedures, size: 12" x 9", cover: chrome coat 200, soft bound, inside pages: C2S90, total pages for 1 set: 577 (excluding cover), total sheets for 1 set: 288.5 (excluding cover), full color, binding: saddle stitch, with pocket/set (10 booklets/set)	150	set	₱ 1,920.00	₱ 288,000.00
3	Brochure of Various Kinds, C2S80, size: 8.5" x 11", full color, 1 fold, 2 panels, 4 kinds, packed by 100s	4,000	piece	₱ 4.35	₱ 17,400.00
4	Flyer of Various Kinds, C2S80, size: 8.5" x 11", full color, 2 folds, 3 panels, 4 kinds, packed by 100s	4,000	piece	₱ 4.35	₱ 17,400.00

5	Leaflet of Various Kinds, size: 8.5" x 11", full color, C2S80, 2 folds, 3 panels, 4 kinds, packed by 100s	4,000	piece	₱ 5.60	₱ 22,400.00
6	Poster of Various Kinds, size: 18" x 24", full color, Chrome Coat# 189, 4 kinds, packed by 100s	4,000	piece	₱ 19.18	₱ 76,720.00
7	Printing of NTP MOP 6th edition Pocket Guide, 92 pages (46 sheets) excluding cover, back to back printing, soft bond, 1/2 A4 cover page: C2S120 in full color, inside page: C2S80 in full color	300	piece	₱ 147.18	₱ 44,154.00
8	Printing of NTP MOP 6th edition, 190 pages (95 sheets) excluding cover, back to back printing, soft bond, A4 cover page: C2S120 in full color, inside page: C2S80 in full color	200	piece	₱ 248.00	₱ 49,600.00
10	Reproduction of FWBD CPG (Reference Manual), Size: 5 1/2"(W) x 8 1/2"(L); Stock: Cover-C2S140#, Inside-Matt 80#; Color: Cover-Full Color (4/0) with Matte Lamination, Inside-Full Color (4/4); No. of pages: 120 pp. excluding Cover; Binding: Perfect Binding; Others: with Die Cut Paper per Divider	150	copy	₱ 357.00	₱ 53,550.00
11	Reproduction of FWBD MOP, Size: 5 1/2"(W) x 8 1/2"(L); Stock: Cover-C2S140#, Inside-Matt 80#; Color: Cover-Full Color (4/0) with Matte Lamination, Inside-Full Color (4/4); No. of pages: 120 pp. excluding Cover; Binding: Perfect Binding	150	copy	₱ 357.00	₱ 53,550.00
14	Reproduction of Pinggang Pinay Brochure for different age groups: Kids 3-12 years old, 13-185 years old, Adults 19-59 years old, Elderly 60 years and above, and Pregnant and Lactating Women; 1 set is to 5 brochures; jsize: 17" x 11" (spread), stock: C2S #120 with UV Lamination two sides, color: Full Color, 3 folds with scoring two sides printing, process: Offset Printing	1,285	set	₱ 68.50	₱ 88,022.50
16	Reproduction/Reprinting of Community Maternal Nutrition and Infant and Young Child Feeding Peer Counselling Training Toolkit PARTICIPANT's MANUAL, 274 pages back to back, full color, spring binded, clear PVC cover, printed at the last page: (DOH Logo) Reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera	235	piece	₱ 394.00	₱ 92,590.00
17	Sintra Board with Benefits of Breastfeeding print for Mommies and Babies, size: 24 inches x 18 inches, 3mm thick, durable surface, flexible, resist moisture and decay, printed on the lower right part: (DOH Logo) reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera	100	piece	₱ 360.00	₱ 36,000.00
18	Sintra Board with Ten Steps to Successful Breastfeeding print, size: 36 inches x 24 inches, 3mm thick, durable surface, flexible, resist moisture and decay, printed on the lower right part: (DOH Logo) reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera	165	piece	₱ 480.00	₱ 79,200.00
19	Sintra Board with The Risks of Formula Feeding, size: 24 inches x 18 inches, 3mm thick, durable surface, flexible, resist moisture and decay, printed on the lower right part: (DOH Logo) reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera	61	piece	₱ 360.00	₱ 21,960.00
20	Sticker of Various Kinds, size: 8" x 4", matte finish, self adhesive, full color, 4 kinds, packed by 100s	4,000	piece	₱ 6.60	₱ 26,400.00
TOTAL					₱ 1,016,146.50

WHEREAS, the following items were declared failed bid:

NO BID

- Item No. 9** - Reproduction of FWBD CPG (Pocket Guide), Size: 5"(W) x 7"(L); Stock: Cover-C2S140#, Inside-Matt 80#; Color: Cover-Full Color (4/2) with UV Lamination, Inside-Full Color (4/4); No. of pages: 31 pp. excluding Cover; Binding: Perfect Binding; Others: with Die Cut Paper per Divider
- Item No. 12** - Reproduction of GMEF Handbook, specifications: 11" x 8.5", 75 pages, saddle stitch binding, inside pages: C2S80, cover page: chrome coat 189, back to back
- Item No. 13** - Reproduction of HGDC Handbook, specifications: 11" x 8.5", 195 pages, saddle stitch binding, inside pages: C2S80/black and white, cover page: chrome coat 189/colored/back to back
- Item No. 15** - Reproduction/Reprinting of Community Maternal Nutrition and Infant and Young Child Feeding Peer Counselling Training Toolkit FACILITATOR's MANUAL, 258 pages back to back, full color, spring binded, clear PVC cover, printed at the last page: (DOH Logo) Reproduced by: Center for Health Development-Cordillera

For all items declared as "FAILED BID", specifically item nos. 9, 12, 13 & 15, the end-user is mandated to review the technical specifications and if necessary, adjust the ABC subject to the required approvals and for re-bidding with re-advertisement and/or posting, as prescribed in Section 21.2 of the Revised Implementing Rules and Regulations of the Republic Act No. 9184.

UNANIMOUSLY APPROVED this 15th day of September, 2020 at the Department of Health-Center for Health Development-Cordillera Administrative Region, BGHMC Compound, Baguio City.

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BAC)



DIANA D. PALANGCHAO
Provisional Member


PATRICK P. PINEDA
Provisional Member


ALEXEI P. MARRERO, MD
BAC Member


SHELLY M. ARAL, MD, MCHD
BAC Member

ATTY. VERONICA ZANDRA DE JESUS-SOWAKEN
BAC Member


ARCELY D. SANCHEZ, MBA
BAC Vice Chairperson


JANICE Z. BUGTONG, MD, MM, CESE
BAC Chairperson

Approved by:


RUBY C. CONSTANTINO, MD, MPH, CESO IV
Director IV