



Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
CENTER FOR HEALTH DEVELOPMENT
 Cordillera Administrative Region
 Baguio City



BAC Resolution No. 2020-104
IB 2020-17 Re-Bid (HFEP)
Package VI-PROCUREMENT OF ASSORTED MEDICAL EQUIPMENT

RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR Items No. 1, 4, 5, 6, 7, & 8, and DECLARING FAILURE OF BIDDING FOR Items No. 2 & 3 FOR THE PROCUREMENT OF MEDICAL MACHINES (Package V) RE-BID under HEALTH FACILITY ENHANCEMENT PROGRAM (HFEP) for CY 2020 REQUIREMENTS

WHEREAS, Open Competitive Bidding for the Procurement of Assorted Medical Equipment (Package VI) Re-Bid under Health Facility Enhancement Program (HFEP) for CY 2020 requirements was conducted in accordance with the Republic Act 9184 (RA 9184) and its Revised Implementing Rules and Regulations;

WHEREAS, on September 12, 2020, the Invitation to Bid (IB) was posted in the PhilGEPS;

WHEREAS, a Pre-bidding Conference was held on September 21, 2020 at 10:00 am at DOH-CAR Office Regional Training Center, BGHMC Compound, Baguio City where four (4) prospective bidders attended, namely:

1. Jojo Humilan – Labmate Pharma Inc.
2. Julie Ann Uy – BDSscientia Medical and Diagnostic Supplies
3. Krizzia Mae Bello – Drake Marketing and Equipment Corporation
4. Gloty Mae Babaran – Everyday Enterprise

WHEREAS, the Submission and Opening of Bids took place as scheduled on October 05, 2020 at 10:00 am at the Regional Training Center, Department of the Health-Center for Health Development-Cordillera Administrative Region (DOH-CHD-CAR) Office, BGHMC Compound, Baguio City;

WHEREAS, three (3) prospective bidders procured the bidding documents and submitted their respective proposal, namely:

1. BDSscientia Medical and Diagnostic Supplies
2. Surgico Phils. Inc.
3. Zymed Medical Distributors

WHEREAS, the first envelopes containing the Eligibility and Technical Documents were opened. The presence, completeness and correctness of the required documents were checked and verified by the designated Bids and Awards Committee (BAC). Upon checking, BDSscientia Medical and Diagnostic Supplies was declared “NOT ELIGIBLE” and was rated “FAILED” because they only submitted one (1) envelope for the five (5) packages under IB 2020-17 (Re-Bid), while, Surgico Phils. Inc. and Zymed Medical Distributors were declared “ELIGIBLE” and were rated “PASSED”;

WHEREAS, the second envelope containing the Financial Proposal was opened. The presence, completeness and correctness of the required documents were checked and verified by the BAC. Upon checking, Surgico Phils. Inc. and Zymed Medical Distributors were declared “ELIGIBLE”, were rated “PASSED” and subsequently the bid proposals were read publicly and written in the Abstract of Bids, to wit:

IB 2020-17 (Re-Bid) Procurement of Assorted Medical Equipment-Package VI							
Name of Company						Surgico Phils. Inc.	Zymed Medical Distributors
Bid Security Form						BSD	BSD
Amount of Security						N/A	N/A
Item No.	Item/Specification	Total Qty.	Unit	ABC per Unit	Total ABC		
1	Laryngoscope, Fiber Optic, Adult/Pedia/Neonate	14	set	21,000.00	294,000.00	291,200.00	294,000.00
2	Mechanical Rotator	1	piece	41,000.00	41,000.00	NO BID	NO BID

3	Non-Contact Thermometer (Infrared)	50	piece	5,000.00	250,000.00	225,000.00	150,000.00
4	Ophthalmoscope	1	set	20,000.00	20,000.00	NO BID	20,000.00
5	Otoscope	1	piece	20,000.00	20,000.00	NO BID	20,000.00
6	Oxygen Tank 10lbs with complete accessories: (gauge, regulator, bubbler, cannula, pedia and adult mask)	8	set	12,000.00	96,000.00	NO BID	72,000.00
7	Oxygen Tank 50lbs with regulator and gauge (complete with accessories: gauge, regulator, bubbler, cannula, pedia and adult mask)	10	set	20,000.00	200,000.00	NO BID	150,000.00
8	Pulse Oximeter Pocket Type	24	set	8,000.00	192,000.00	188,400.00	72,000.00

WHEREAS, the bids for the items listed below were found to be substantially complying;

Item No. 1 – Laryngoscope, Fiber Optic, Adult/Pedia/Neonate

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Surgico Phils. Inc.	₱ 294,000.00	₱ 291,200.00	0.95 %
2	Zymed Medical Distributors	₱ 294,000.00	₱ 294,000.00	0.00 %

Item No. 3 – Non-Contact Thermometer (Infrared)

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Surgico Phils. Inc.	₱ 250,000.00	₱ 225,000.00	10.00 %
2	Zymed Medical Distributors	₱ 250,000.00	₱ 150,000.00	40.00 %

Item No. 4 – Ophthalmoscope

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
2	Zymed Medical Distributors	₱ 20,000.00	₱ 20,000.00	0.00 %

Item No. 5 – Otoscope

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
2	Zymed Medical Distributors	₱ 20,000.00	₱ 20,000.00	0.00 %

Item No. 6 – Oxygen Tank 10lbs with complete accessories: (gauge, regulator, bubbler, cannula, pedia and adult mask)

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
2	Zymed Medical Distributors	₱ 96,000.00	₱ 72,000.00	25.00 %

Item No. 7 – Oxygen Tank 50lbs with regulator and gauge (complete with accessories: gauge, regulator, bubbler, cannula, pedia and adult mask)

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
2	Zymed Medical Distributors	₱ 200,000.00	₱ 150,000.00	25.00 %

Item No. 8 – Pulse Oximeter Pocket Type

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Surgico Phils. Inc.	₱ 192,000.00	₱ 188,400.00	1.87 %
2	Zymed Medical Distributors	₱ 192,000.00	₱ 72,000.00	62.50 %

WHEREAS, letter of disqualification dated October 06, 2020 was sent to BDScientia Medical and Diagnostic Supplies and was advised that they may file a request for reconsideration. A request for reconsideration was received last October 07, 2020 from BDScientia Medical and Diagnostic Supplies. A reply letter dated October 23, 2020 was sent to them denying their request.

WHEREAS, letter dated October 06, 2020 was sent to the Lowest Calculated Bidders (LCBs), Surgico Phils. Inc. and Zymed Medical Distributors, requesting to submit post qualification requirements;

WHEREAS, on October 08 & 12, 2020, Zymed Medical Distributors and Surgico Phils. Inc. submitted respectively their additional documentary requirements as part of their technical requirements;

WHEREAS, on October 09, 2020, detailed evaluation of the submitted proposal on the Legal, Technical and Financial aspects of documents on the Lowest Calculated Bidder (LCB) for the above items was undertaken by the designated Technical Working Group (TWG);

WHEREAS, on October 26, 2020, the TWG presented to the BAC and submitted their Bid Evaluation and Post Qualification Reports citing specific findings on the submitted documents/clarifications by the LCB for each item;

WHEREAS, the bids for the following items failed to comply with, and be responsive to, the requirements and conditions specified for the said project;

Item No.	Item	Total Amount	Bidder's Company Name	Findings
3	NON-CONTACT THERMOMETER (INFRARED)	150,000.00	Zymed Medical Distributors	Not complying on the following: 1. Temperature Sensor: Required: Ear, Forehead, Ambient Temperature, and Liquid Temperature Offered: Forehead 2. Measuring Distance: Required: 5-15cm Offered: 1-3cm 3. Memory: Required: ≥ 64 recalls Offered: 20 recalls 4. No Certificate of Product Registration attached.
			Surgico Phils. Inc.	Not complying on the following: 1. No Certificate of Product Registration attached.
8	PULSE OXIMETER POCKET TYPE	72,000.00	Zymed Medical Distributors	Not complying on the following: 1. No shock resistant protective cover 2. No current and valid certificate of manufacturer's compliance to ISO 13485

WHEREAS, letter dated October 27, 2020 was sent to Zymed Medical Distributors and Surgico Phils. Inc. informing them about the findings and was advised that they may file a motion for reconsideration. However, none was received;

WHEREAS, since no request for reconsideration was received from Zymed Medical Distributors for item no. 8, the TWG proceeded with the post-qualification of the second LCB, Surgico Phils. Inc., which was evaluated as compliant and responsive;

NOW THEREFORE, on the basis of the above, the herein members of the BAC HEREBY RESOLVE, to award the item listed below to the following bidders that were determined to have the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bids (LCRBs):

- Surgico Phils. Inc. with a Total Contract Price of Four Hundred Seventy-Nine Thousand Six Hundred Pesos only (₱ 479,600.00) inclusive of local taxes for the items listed below:**

Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Cost	Total Bid Price (PhP)
1	Laryngoscope, Fiber Optic, Adult/Pedia/Neonate	14	set	₱ 20,800.00	₱ 291,200.00
8	Pulse Oximeter Pocket Type	24	set	₱ 7,850.00	₱ 188,400.00
TOTAL					₱ 479,600.00

2. Zymed Medical Distributors with a Total Contract Price of Two Hundred Sixty-Two Thousand Pesos only (₱ 262,000.00) inclusive of local taxes for the items listed below:

Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Cost	Total Bid Price (PhP)
4	Ophthalmoscope	1	set	₱ 20,000.00	₱ 20,000.00
5	Otoscope	1	piece	₱ 20,000.00	₱ 20,000.00
6	Oxygen Tank 10lbs with complete accessories: (gauge, regulator, bubbler, cannula, pedia and adult mask)	8	set	₱ 9,000.00	₱ 72,000.00
7	Oxygen Tank 50lbs with regulator and gauge (complete with accessories: gauge, regulator, bubbler, cannula, pedia and adult mask)	10	set	₱ 15,000.00	₱ 150,000.00
TOTAL					₱ 262,000.00

WHEREAS, the following items were declared failed bid:

NO BID

Item No. 2 – Mechanical Rotator

BIDDERS DID NOT COMPLY WITH THE REQUIREMENTS/TECHNICAL SPECIFICATION

Item No. 3 – Non-Contact Thermometer (Infrared)

For all items declared as “**FAILED BID**”, specifically item no. 2 & 3, the end-user is mandated to review the technical specifications and if necessary, adjust the ABC subject to the required approvals, and since this is the second “failed” bidding, the BAC recommends Negotiated Procurement under Republic Act 9184 Section 53 and its revised Implementing Rules and Regulations.

UNANIMOUSLY APPROVED this 11 day of November 2020 at the Department of Health-Center for Health Development-Cordillera Administrative Region, BGHMC Compound, Baguio City.

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BAC)

ANACHRIS M. KILAKIL, MD
Provisional Member

JENNIFER JOYCE B. PIRA, MD, MDM
Provisional Member


ALEXEI P. MARRERO, MD
BAC Member

SHELLY M. ARAL, MD, MCHD
BAC Member


ATTY. VERONICA ZANDRA DE JESUS-SOWAKEN
BAC Member


ARCELY D. SANCHEZ, MBA
BAC Vice Chairperson


JANICE Z. BUGTONG, MD, MM, CESE
BAC Chairperson

Approved by:


RUBY C. CONSTANTINO, MD, MPH, CESO IV
Director IV