Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
CENTER FOR HEALTH DEVELOPMENT
Cordillera Administrative Region
Baguio City

BAC Resolution No. 2020-40
IB 2020-11 RE-BID (REGULAR) -
Package I - PROCUREMENT OF DRUGS AND MEDICINES

: i i No. 5, and
RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR PACKAGE 1 specifically Item s 'S, §
DECLARING FAILURE OF BIDDING for Item Nos. 1,2,3,4,6,7 & 8 FOR THE PROCUREMENT
DRUGS and MEDICINES for CY 2020 REQUIREMENTS

WHEREAS. Open Competitive Bidding for the Procurement of Drugs and Medicines for CY 2020 require.ments was
conducted in accordance with the Republic Act 9184 (RA 9184) and its Revised Implementing Rules and Regulations:

WHEREAS, on April 22, 2020. the Invitation to Bid (IB) was posted in the PhilGEPS and DOH Website:

WHEREAS, a Pre-bidding Conference was held on April 30, 2020 at 10:00 am at DOH-CAR Office Regional Training
Center, BGHMC Compound, Baguio City no prospective bidder/s attended:

WHEREAS. the Submission and Opening of Bids took place as scheduled on May 12, 2020 at 10:00 am at the Regional
Training Center. Department of the Health-Center for Health Development-Cordillera Administrative Region (DOH-CHD-
CAR) Office. BGHMC Compound. Baguio City:

WHEREAS. one (1) prospective bidder. Metro Drug. Inc.. procured the bidding documents and submitted their respective
proposal:

WHEREAS, the first envelope containing the Eligibility and Technical Documents was opened. The presence, completeness
and correctness of the required documents was checked and verified by the designated Bids and Awards Committee (BAC).
Upon checking., Metro Drug, Inc. was declared “ELIGIBLIE” and was rated “PASSED:

WHEREAS, the second envelope containing the Financial Proposal was opened. The presence, completeness and correctness
of the required documents were checked and verified by the BAC. Upon checking. Metro Drug. Inc. was declared
“ELIGIBLE”, was rated “PASSED” and subsequently the bid proposal was read publicly and written in the Abstract of Bids.
to wit:

IB 2020-11 Procurement of Drugs and Medicines (Package 1) Re-Bid

Name of Company Metro Drug,

Inc.
Bid Security Form ILC (BPI)
Amount of Security 65,360.24
Item No. Item/Specification Total Unit ABC per Total ABC
Quantity Unit
Biperidine Hydrochloride 2 mg tablet. blister pack "
I P > £ P 20 box | 525.00 10,500.00 NO BID

x 10's box of 100's

CAMPOLAS KIT- PLUS, Content : Cotrimoxazole
800 mg + 160 mg Tablet 45 TP- 7 Boxes
100tabs/box, Cotrimoxazole 200 mg + 40 mg
Suspension, 60 ml 20 Bottle, Amoxicillin
500mg,cap 45 TP- 10 boxes 100cap/box,
Amoxicillin 250mg/Sml.suspension.60ml 20 Bot.
Metformin 500mg,tab, 2 box- 100 tabs/box.

5] Paracetamol 250mg/Sml.syrup.60ml, 20 bot. 17 kit 14.300.00 | 243.100.00 NO BID
ORESOL, 10 sachet/box 3 Box .Lagundi
300mg/Smlsyrup,120ml 20 bot, Lagundi
300mg.tab 600 tab.- 100 tabs/box. Sulfur
ointment.30g, 10 tube, Fusidate/Fucidic acid 20
tube, Imidazole 10 tube, Losartan 500mg.tab 3 box-
30mg, 100 tabs/box .Vitamin A.200.000
iU/cap/bottle 1 bot- 100 caps/bottle
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Carbamazepine 20mg, blister pack x 10 box of 320 box 225.00 72,000.00 NO BID
3 oot
4 Chlorpromazine 200mg blister pack x 10 box of 9 box 234.00 2,106.00 NO BID
100's
310,800.00
5 Divalproex Sodium 250 mg tablet, blister pack x 10 350 box 1496.00 | 523,600.00 IOSmox-(ggf_gr(i
box of 100's e box)
6 Losartan 50 mg tablet, blister pack, box of 100's 4717 box 86.00 41,022.00 NO BID
7 Meningococcal Pplysaccharide Vaccine (ACWY), 45 vial 1,760.00 79.200.00 NO BID
Single dose per vial
8 Risperidone 2 mg, blister pack x 10 box of 100's 90 box 378.00 34,020.00 NO BID

WHEREAS, the bids for the items listed below were found to be substantially complying;

Item No. 1 - Divalproex Sodium 250 mg tablet, blister pack x 10 box of 100's (offer: 10s/box; 88.80 per box)

Bidder Name of Company ABC (PhP) Bid as Calculated % Variance
No. from ABC
1 Metro Drug, Inc. $523,600.00 #310,800.00 40.64 %

WHEREAS, letter dated May 13, 2020 was sent to the Single/Lowest Calculated Bidder (SCB/LCB), Metro Drug, Inc.,
requesting to submit post qualification requirements;

WHEREAS, on May 18, 2020, Metro Drug, Inc. submitted their respective additional documentary requirements as part of
their technical requirements;

WHEREAS, on May 20-21, 2020, detailed evaluation of the submitted proposal on the Legal, Technical and Financial aspects
of documents on the Single/Lowest Calculated Bidder (SCB/LCB) for the above items was undertaken by the designated
Technical Working Group (TWG);

WHEREAS, on May 28, 2020, the submitted their Bid Evaluation and Post Qualification Reports citing specific findings on
the submitted documents/clarifications by the LCB for each item;

WHEREAS, the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC) certifies that there is “no pending incident” as regard to the result of the
post qualification evaluation for this particular project;

NOW THEREFORE, on the basis of the above, the herein members of the BAC HEREBY RESOLVE, to award the items

listed below to the following bidders that were determined to have the Lowest/Single Calculated and Responsive Bid
(LCRB/SCRB):

1. Metro Drug, Inc. with a Total Contract Price of Three Hundred Ten Thousand Eight Hundred Pesos only
(P 310,800.00) inclusive of local taxes for the item listed below:

Item Description Quantity | Unit Unit Cost | Total Bid Price
No. (PhP)

Divalproex Sodium 250 mg tablet, blister pack x 10
box of 100's

Generic Name: Valproic Acid 250mg, extended release
tablet, 10’s (equivalent to Divalproex)

Brand Name: DEPAMAX 250mg, extended release ll3)ox
5 | tablet, 10’s (equivalent to Divalproic Sodium) 3500 ( c;x P 88.80 P 310,800.00
Manufacturer: Akums Drugs & Pharmaceuticals Ltd. 18
Country of Origin: India 5)
Shelf Life: 24 months
Offer: Box of 10s
TOTAL P 310,800.00
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WHEREAS, the following items were declared failed bid:

NO BID

[tem No
Item No

Item No
Item No
Item No
Item No
Item No

. | - Biperidine Hydrochloride 2 mg tablet, blister pack x 10's box of 100's

.2 - CAMPOLAS KIT- PLUS, Content : Cotrimoxazole 800 mg + 160 mg Tablet 45 TP- 7 Boxes 100tabs/box,
Cotrimoxazole 200 mg + 40 mg Suspension, 60 ml 20 Bottle, Amoxicillin 500mg,cap 45 TP- 10 boxes
100cap/box, Amoxicillin 250mg/Smlsuspension,60ml 20 Bot, Metformin 500mg,tab, 2 box- 100 tabs/box,
Paracetamol 250mg/5ml,syrup,60ml, 20 bot, ORESOL,10 sachet/box 3 Box ,Lagundi 300mg/5ml,syrup,120ml
20 bot, Lagundi 300mg,tab 600 tab,- 100 tabs/box, Sulfur ointment,30g, 10 tube, Fusidate/Fucidic acid 20 tube,
Imidazole 10 tube, Losartan 500mg,tab 3 box- 50mg, 100 tabs/box ,Vitamin A,200,000 iU/cap/bottle 1 bot- 100
caps/bottle

. 3 - Carbamazepine 20mg, blister pack x 10 box of 100's

.4 - Chlorpromazine 200mg blister pack x 10 box of 100's

. 6 - Losartan 50 mg tablet, blister pack, box of 100's

. 7 - Meningococcal Polysaccharide Vaccine (ACWY), Single dose per vial

. 8 - Risperidone 2 mg, blister pack x 10 box of 100's

For all items declared as “FAILED BID”, specifically item nos. 1. 2, 3, 4, 6, 7 & 8. the end-user is mandated to review the

technica

| specifications and if necessary. adjust the ABC subject to the required approvals. The BAC recommends Negotiated

Procurement under Republic Act 9184 Section 53 and its revised Implementing Rules and Regulations.

UNANI
Cordille

e
ATTY. VERONQ;

MOUSLY APPROVED this 29" day of May, 2020 at the Department of Health-Center for Health Development-
ra Administrative Region. BGHMC Compound, Baguio City.

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BAC)

ANACHRIS M. KILAKIL, MD JENNIFER JOYCE

Provisional Member Provision

. PIRA, MD, MDM

g;;]?ﬁ([il P MARRERO, MD SHELLY M. ARAL, MD, MCHD
BAC Member BAC Member

iy i
! DRA DE JESUS-SOWAKEN ARCELY D. SANCHEZ, MBA
ember BAC Vice Chairperson

/

JANICE Z. BUGTONG, MD, MM, CESE
BAC Chairperson

AMELITA M.%EGI INAN, MD, MPH, CESO IV
OIC-Director IV
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