



Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
CENTER FOR HEALTH DEVELOPMENT
 Cordillera Administrative Region
 Baguio City



BAC Resolution No. 2020-03
IB 2020-01 (REGULAR)
Package II - PROCUREMENT OF MEDICAL and DENTAL SUPPLIES

RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR PACKAGE II specifically Item Nos. 1, 6, 7, 9 & 11, and, DECLARING FAILURE OF BIDDING for Item Nos. 2, 3, 4, 5, 8, 10 & 12 FOR THE PROCUREMENT MEDICAL and DENTAL SUPPLIES for CY 2020 REQUIREMENTS

WHEREAS, Open Competitive Bidding for the Procurement of Medical and Dental Supplies for CY 2020 requirements was conducted in accordance with the Republic Act 9184 (RA 9184) and its Revised Implementing Rules and Regulations;

WHEREAS, on December 05, 2019, the Invitation to Bid (IB) was posted in the PhilGEPS and DOH Website;

WHEREAS, a Pre-bidding Conference was held on December 13, 2019 at 10:00 am at DOH-CAR Office Regional Training Center, BGHMC Compound, Baguio City where six (6) prospective bidders attended, namely:

1. Ms. Josephine M. Cruz – Sterilab Co.
2. Mr. Jumar Regal – Irvine True & frank Carson Phils. Inc.
3. Mr. Ernesto Pagar – Northeast Mdical Trading
4. Ms. Dannlyn Tandoc – Medical Center Trading Corp.
5. Ms. Rejoice Abrantes – Metro Drug Inc.
6. Ms. Donna Villamil - NMPC

WHEREAS, Supplemental Bid Bulletin No. 1 dated December 18, 2019, was issued to modify or amend the Invitation to Bid and the technical specifications;

WHEREAS, the Submission and Opening of Bids took place as scheduled on December 27, 2019 at 10:00 am at the Regional Training Center, Department of the Health-Center for Health Development-Cordillera Administrative Region (DOH-CHD-CAR) Office, BGHMC Compound, Baguio City;

WHEREAS, one (1) prospective bidder, Northeast Medical Trading, procured the bidding documents and submitted their respective proposal;

WHEREAS, the first envelope containing the Eligibility and Technical Documents were opened. The presence, completeness and correctness of the required documents was checked and verified by the RBAC in the presence of the prospective bidders' representative. Upon checking, Northeast Medical Trading was declared "ELIGIBLE" and was rated "PASSED";

WHEREAS, the second envelope containing the Financial Proposals were opened. The presence, completeness and correctness of the required documents was checked and verified by the RBAC. Upon checking, Northeast Medical Trading was declared "ELIGIBLE", was rated "PASSED" and subsequently the bid proposals were read publicly and written in the Abstract of Bids, to wit:

IB 2020-01 Procurement of Medical and Dental Supplies (Package II)						
Name of Company						Northeast Medical Trading
Bid Security Form						Bank Guarantee
Amount of Security						₱ 8,000.00
Item No.	Item/Specification	Total Quantity	Unit	ABC per Unit	Total ABC	
1	Alcohol 70% Ethyl, 500 ml	30	bot	53.08	1,592.40	1,590.00
2	Chlorine granules,50-70%active chlorine in plastic container, tightly, sealed (screw capped),3kg/jar	70	jar	500.00	35,000.00	NO BID

3	Condoms, latex, lubricated, 3 pcs/box flavored (any)	19,200	box	9.90	190,080.00	NO BID
4	FAMILY KIT, Content : Hydrogen Peroxide 3% solution,60ml , Povidone iodine 10% solution,60ml , Fucidate na/acid,5g- 5gms tube in a box- 1 bottle ,Oral rehydrating salts (ORS 75 replacement)- 20.5 gms/sachet- 1 sachet - , Paracetamol 500mg,tab- 10 tablets -, Silver sulfadiazine 1% cream,25g- 1 tube in a box, Lagundi 300mg,tab- 10 tablets ,Gauze pads,2x2 inches ,8ply,24x20 mesh,sterile, individually packed- 5 packs ,Surgical paper tape, hypoallergenic,(1/2 inchx 10 yards),- 1 roll, Cotton,absorbent,12g,individually packed- 1 Roll ,Plaster strips, soft absorbent layer, perforated strips, strong adhesive non stick film,- 5 pieces, Bayabas herbal soap,- 25 gms/bar in box- 1 bar, Instruction guide for family kit (laminated)- 1 pc, Family kit bag - 1 pc	50	kit	650.00	32,500.00	NO BID
5	FIRST AID KIT, Content : Surgical gloves sz. 7, Elastic bandage 4 inches x 5 yards- 10cm x 1.6 unstretched approx. 4.5 m, stretched,- 5 pairs Cotton,absorbent,25g,individually packed- 1 pack, Bandage scissors, stainless,(14cm)- 1 pair, Triangular Bandage,100% cotton, white, w/ 2 safety pins,(40"x40"x56") , individually packed,1 pc Gauze pads,2x2 inches ,8ply,24x20 mesh, sterile, individually packed- 100 packs/box ,Gauze pads,4x4 inches,8ply,24x20 mesh. sterile, individually packed- 100 packs/box, Surgical paper tape, hypoallergenic,(1 inchx 10 yards)-per roll- 1 roll ,Gauze bandage,2"x 6 yards,24x20 mesh, individually packed- individually packed in a box - 1 roll, Gauze bandage,4"x 6 yards,24x20 mesh, individually packed- individually packed in a box , Plaster strips, soft absorbent layer, perforated strips, strong adhesive non stick film - 10 pcs , Hydrogen Peroxide 3% solution,60ml- 60ml/plastic bottle- 1 bottle , Povidone iodine 10% solution,60ml- 60ml/plastic bottle- 1 bottle ,Calamine lotion,60ml- 60ml/plastic bottle- 1 bottle, Oral rehydrating salts (ORS 75 replacement)- 20.5 gms/sachet- 5 packs, Paracetamol 500mg,tab- 30 tabs, Lagundi 300mg,tab- 30 tabs , Mefenamic acid 500mg,cap- 30 caps ,Silver sulfadiazine 1% cream,25g- 25 gms/tube, Fucidate na/acid,5g- 5 gms/tube-1 tube, Amoxicillin 500mg, cap - 30 caps, Bayabas herbal soap- 65 gms- 1 bar, Clonidine 150mcg,tab , Citirizine 10mg,tab , Instruction guide for first aid kit (Laminated),First aid kit bag (qty per item)	70	kit	1,100.00	77,000.00	NO BID
6	Gauze Pad 4x4 pack, 8 ply, 24x28 mesh, sterile, pack x 10s (100 packs per box)	17	packs	302.50	5,142.50	5,015.00
7	Gloves, unsterile, medium, 100/box	4	box	200.00	800.00	760.00
8	HYGIENE KIT Content Hygiene Kit. 1 plastic bucket with lid, plastic with 12 liters capacity, with DOH Logo 6"x6"- lock zip tie; with the following Contents: 1 pc face towel, cotton, 10"x10"; 1 pc bath towel, cotton, 48x26 inches; 3 pcs adult toothbrush, soft bristle; 3pcs kiddie toothbrush, soft bristle; 1 pack sanitary napkin, 8pcs; 1 toothpaste, 50ml- 145 gms; 1 bath soap, at least 60g,- 135 gms mild scent; 1 laundry soap- 2 detergent bar, 420mg, 2 tissue rolls; underwear for women, cotton (3 pcs small size,	50	kit	1,700.00	85,000.00	NO BID

	3 pcs medium size, 3 pcs large size); underwear for men, cotton (3 pcs small size, 3 pcs medium size, 3 pcs large size); 1 comb; 2 pairs Slippers size 8; 1 chamber pot; 1 pack (baby) diaper, 4 pcs per pack, size large.					
9	Kidney Basin, stainless, 8 inches	4	piece	200.00	800.00	780.00
10	Speculum, pederson, lateral screw, stainless steel, medium size	6	piece	1,000.00	6,000.00	NO BID
11	Surgical Mask, with ear loop, disposable, 50pcs per box	4	box	423.50	1,694.00	380.00
12	Surgical medical tray, stainless steel, 2" H, 9.5"L, 6.3"W4 pcs	4	piece	900.00	3,600.00	NO BID

WHEREAS, the bids for the items listed below were found to be substantially complying;

Item No. 1 - Alcohol 70% Ethyl, 500 ml

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Northeast Medical Trading	₱ 1,592.40	₱ 1,590.00	0.15 %

Item No. 6 - Gauze Pad 4x4 pack, 8 ply, 24x28 mesh, sterile, pack x 10s (100 packs per box)

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Northeast Medical Trading	₱ 5,142.50	₱ 5,015.00	2.48 %

Item No. 7 - Gloves, unsterile, medium, 100/box

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Northeast Medical Trading	₱ 800.00	₱ 760.00	5.00 %

Item No. 9 - Kidney Basin, stainless, 8 inches

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Northeast Medical Trading	₱ 800.00	₱ 780.00	2.50 %

Item No. 11 - Surgical Mask, with ear loop, disposable, 50pcs per box

Bidder No.	Name of Company	ABC (PhP)	Bid as Calculated	% Variance from ABC
1	Northeast Medical Trading	₱ 1,694.00	₱ 380.00	77.57 %

WHEREAS, letter dated December 28, 2019 was sent to the Lowest/Single Calculated Bidder (LCB/SCB), Northeast Medical Trading, requesting to submit post qualification requirements;

WHEREAS, on January 7, 2020, Northeast Medical Trading submitted their respective additional documentary requirements as part of their technical requirements;

WHEREAS, on January 9-15, 2020, detailed evaluation of the submitted proposal on the Legal, Technical and Financial aspects of documents on the Lowest Calculated Bidders (LCBs) for the above items was undertaken by the designated Technical Working Group (TWG);

WHEREAS, on January 22, 2022, the TWG presented to the BAC and submitted their Bid Evaluation and Post Qualification Reports citing specific findings on the submitted documents/clarifications by the LCB for each item;

WHEREAS, the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC) certifies that there is "no pending incident" as regard to the result of the post qualification evaluation for this particular project;

NOW THEREFORE, on the basis of the above, the herein members of the BAC HEREBY RESOLVE, to award the items listed below to the following bidders that were determined to have the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bids (LCRBs):

1. Northeast Medical Trading with a Total Contract Price of Eight Thousand Five Hundred Twenty-Five Pesos only (₱ 8,525.00) inclusive of local taxes for the item listed below:

Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Cost	Total Bid Price (PhP)
1	Alcohol 70% Ethyl, 500 ml	30	bottle	₱ 53.00	₱ 1,590.00
6	Gauze Pad 4x4 pack, 8 ply, 24x28 mesh, sterile, pack x 10s (100 packs per box)	17	pack	₱ 295.00	₱ 5,015.00
7	Gloves, unsterile, medium, 100/box	4	box	₱ 190.00	₱ 760.00
9	Kidney Basin, stainless, 8 inches	4	piece	₱ 195.00	₱ 780.00
11	Surgical Mask, with ear loop, disposable, 50pcs per box	4	box	₱ 95.00	₱ 380.00
TOTAL					₱ 8,525.00

WHEREAS, the following items was declared failed bid:

NO BID

- Item No. 2 - Chlorine granules,50-70%active chlorine in plastic container, tightly, sealed (screw capped),3kg/jar
Item No. 3 - Condoms, latex, lubricated, 3 pcs/box flavored (any)
Item No. 4 - FAMILY KIT, Content : Hydrogen Peroxide 3% solution,60ml , Povidone iodine 10% solution,60ml , Fucidate na/acid,5g- 5gms tube in a box- 1 bottle ,Oral rehydrating salts (ORS 75 replacement)- 20.5 gms/sachet- 1 sachet- , Paracetamol 500mg,tab- 10 tablets -, Silver sulfadiazine 1% cream,25g- 1 tube in a box, Lagundi 300mg,tab- 10 tablets ,Gauze pads,2x2 inches ,8ply,24x20 mesh, sterile, individually packed- 5 packs, Surgical paper tape, hypoallergenic,(1/2 inchx10 yards)- 1 roll, Cotton,absorbent,12g,individually packed- 1 Roll, Plaster strips, soft absorbent layer, perforated strips, strong adhesive non stick film,- 5 pieces, Bayabas herbal soap - 25 gms/bar in box- 1 bar, Instruction guide for family kit (laminated)- 1 pc, Family kit bag - 1 pc
Item No. 5 - FIRST AID KIT, Content : Surgical gloves sz. 7, Elastic bandage 4 inches x 5 yards- 10cm x 1.6 unstretched approx. 4.5 m, stretched,- 5 pairs Cotton,absorbent,25g,individually packed- 1 pack, Bandage scissors, stainless,(14cm)- 1 pair, Triangular Bandage,100% cotton, white, w/ 2 safety pins,(40"x40"x56") , individually packed,1 pc Gauze pads,2x2 inches ,8ply,24x20 mesh, sterile, individually packed- 100 packs/box ,Gauze pads,4x4 inches,8ply,24x20 mesh. sterile, individually packed- 100 packs/box, Surgical paper tape, hypoallergenic,(1 inchx10 yards)-per roll- 1 roll ,Gauze bandage,2"x 6 yards,24x20 mesh, individually packed- individually packed in a box - 1 roll, Gauze bandage,4"x 6 yards,24x20 mesh, individually packed- individually packed in a box , Plaster strips, soft absorbent layer, perforated strips, strong adhesive non stick film - 10 pcs , Hydrogen Peroxide 3% solution,60ml- 60ml/plastic bottle- 1 bottle , Povidone iodine 10% solution,60ml- 60ml/plastic bottle- 1 bottle ,Calamine lotion,60ml- 60ml/plastic bottle- 1 bottle, Oral rehydrating salts (ORS 75 replacement)- 20.5 gms/sachet- 5 packs, Paracetamol 500mg,tab- 30 tabs, Lagundi 300mg,tab- 30 tabs , Mefenamic acid 500mg,cap- 30 caps ,Silver sulfadiazine 1% cream,25g- 25 gms/tube, Fucidate na/acid,5g- 5 gms/tube-1 tube, Amoxicillin 500mg, cap - 30 caps, Bayabas herbal soap- 65 gms- 1 bar, Clonidine 150mcg, tab, Citirizine 10mg,tab , Instruction guide for first aid kit (Laminated),First aid kit bag (qty per item)
Item No. 8 - HYGIENE KIT Content Hygiene Kit. 1 plastic bucket with lid, plastic with 12 liters capacity, with DOH Logo 6"x6"- lock zip tie; with the following Contents: 1 pc face towel, cotton, 10"x10"; 1 pc bath towel, cotton, 48x26 inches; 3 pcs adult toothbrush, soft bristle; 3pcs kiddie toothbrush, soft bristle; 1 pack sanitary napkin, 8pcs; 1 toothpaste, 50ml- 145 gms; 1 bath soap, at least 60g,- 135 gms mild scent; 1 laundry soap- 2 detergent bar, 420mg, 2 tissue rolls; underwear for women, cotton (3 pcs small size, 3 pcs medium size, 3 pcs large size); underwear for men, cotton (3 pcs small size, 3 pcs medium size, 3 pcs large size); 1 comb; 2 pairs Slippers size 8; 1 chamber pot; 1 pack (baby) diaper, 4 pcs per pack, size large.
Item No. 10 - Speculum, pederson, lateral screw, stainless steel, medium size
Item No. 12 - Surgical medical tray, stainless steel, 2" H, 9.5"L, 6.3"W, 4 pcs

For all items declared as "FAILED BID", specifically item nos. 2, 3, 4, 5, 8, 10 & 12, the end-user is mandated to review the technical specifications and if necessary, adjust the ABC subject to the required approvals and for possible re-bidding with re-advertisement and/or posting, as prescribed in Section 21.2 of the Revised Implementing Rules and Regulations of the Republic Act No. 9184.

UNANIMOUSLY APPROVED this 30th day of January, 2020 at the Department of Health-Center for Health Development-Cordillera Administrative Region, BGHMC Compound, Baguio City.

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BAC)


ANACHRIS M. KILAKIL, MD
Provisional Member


JENNIFER JOYCE R. PIRA, MD, MDM
Provisional Member



ALEXEI P. MARRERO, MD
BAC Member


SHELLY M. ARAL, MD
BAC Member


ATTY. VERONICA ZANDRA DE JESUS-SOWAKEN
BAC Member

ARCELY D. SANCHEZ, MBA
BAC Vice Chairperson


JANICE Z. BUGTONG, MD, MM, CESE
BAC Chairperson

Approved by:

AMELITA M. PANGILINAN, MD, MPH, CESO IV
OIC-Director IV